
Bid Tabulation
Water Treatment Plant, Transmission Piping, and Raw Water Intake

Rapid Valley Sanitary District - Water Service
Letting:   December 5, 2006, 2:00 p.m.

Contractor Bid Schedule No. 1 Bid Schedule No. 2 Total Bid Schedule 1 & 2

1 Engineers Estimate 987,092.00$               3,900,000.00$             4,887,092.00$                   

2 Site Work Specialists, Inc. 934,264.80$               NO BID

3 MainLine Contracting, Inc. 940,010.73$               NO BID

4 Highmark, Inc. 942,657.30$               NO BID

5 Heavy Constructors, Inc. 1,191,387.55$            3,195,000.00$             4,386,387.55$                   

6 Quinn Construction, Inc. 1,213,429.46$            NO BID

7 Rapid Construction Company 1,378,200.57$            NO BID

8 MAC Construction Co., Inc. NO BID 3,260,000.00$             

9 Dean Kurtz Construction Co., Inc. NO BID 3,280,000.00$             

10 SECO Construction, Inc. NO BID 3,326,000.00$             

11 Corner Construction ,Inc. NO BID 3,373,400.00$             

12 PKG Contracting, Inc. NO BID 3,499,690.00$             

13 J. Scull Construction Service, Inc. NO BID 3,550,000.00$             
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